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Bid Tabulation February 19, 2019

2019 Grader Blade Material Bid #19-07
Truck & Trailer Specialties of Boyne Falls Winter Equipment Company
Item $/lbs | weight/ft $/ft Item $/Ibs weight/ft $/ft
Front Plow Blades Front Plow Blades
High Carbon Steel Cutting High Carbon Steel Cutting
Edges (Pg 3) Edges (Pg 3)

$0.68 16.831bs | $11.446 $0.73 2.5/2.14 11.04
5/8" x 8" - 6' or 7' lengths 5/8" x 8" - 6' or 7' lengths Ibs
Wing Plow Blades Wing Plow Blades
High Carbon Steel Cutting High Carbon Steel Cutting
Edges (Pg 4) Edges (Pg 4)
5/8" x 8" Curved 9' lengths $0.82 | 16.11lbs | $13.21 5/8" x 8" Curved 9' lengths $0.99 16.55lbs | $16.46
5/8" x 8" Flat $0.82 | 16 Ibs | $13.21 5/8" x 8" Elat $0.94 | 15.421bs | $14.52
Underbody Blades Underbody Blades
Hardened Blades Hardened Blades
5/8" - 7/8" x 8" 67 or 7' | ¢ 083 | 19.661bs | $21.31 5/8" - 7/8" x 8" &' or7 no bid
length length
Sectional Tungsten Sectiona! Tungsten
Carbide Blades(Pg 6) Carbide Blades(Pg 6)
5/8" x 6" Curved 4' lengths | $3:91 | 15.25lbs | $59.63 5/8" x 6" Curved 4' lengths | $6-90 | 12.25lbs | $84.55
3/a" x 6" Flat 4' lengths | $3-71 | 16lbs | $59.36 3/4" x 6" Elat 4' lengths | $5-07 | 14.75lbs | $74.82
7/8" x 5" Flat 4' lengths | $4-31 | 15lbs | $64.65 7/8" x 5" Flat 4' lengths | $5-25 | 14.254lbs | $74.82
Serrated lce Blades(Pg 7) Serrated lce Blades(Pg 7)
3.3/8" space, 1-5/8" tooth | $1:53 | 10.5lbs | $16.065 3.3/8" space, 1-5/8" tooth | $1:19 9 Ibs | $10.75
1-3/16" space, 2-1/8" tooth $1.17 12.51bs | $14.625 1-3/16" space, 2-1/8" tooth $1.19 9 lbs $10.75
Carbide Bit Moldboard Carbide Bit Moldboard
Blades Blades
Motor Grader Moldboard $9.35 17.751bs | $165.96 Motor Grader Moldboard $9.47 23.751bs | $225.14
Blade Blade 3'

Motor Gratlier Mo!dboard $9.51 23.661bs | $225.14
Blade 4

Truck Underbody Moldboard | $9.35 | 17.75lbs | $165.96 Truck Underbody Moldboard 3: $8.10 | 23.75lbs | $192.38
Blade Blade 4' $8.12 | 23.661bs | $192.38
Carbide Bit Tools Carbide Bit Tools
Motor Grader Blades Per Qty Motor Grader Blades Per Qty $11.96
Specified Specified .
Truck Underbody Blades Truck Underbody Blades Per
Per Qty Specified Qty Specified
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Wear Parts and Equipment Co. Inc.

Valk Manufacturing, Inc

Per Qty Specified

Qty Specified

Item $/lbs | weight/ft $/ft Item $/lbs | weight/ft $/ft
Front Plow Blades Front Plow Blades
High Carbon Steel Cutting High Carbon Steel Cutting
Edges (Pg 3) Edges (Pg 3)

$0.65 | 15.001bs $9.75 14 Ibs $12.90
5/8" x 8" - 6' or 7' lengths 5/8" x 8" - 6' or 7' lengths
Wing Plow Blades Wing Plow Blades
High Carbon Steel Cutting High Carbon Steel Cutting
Edges (Pg 4) Edges (Pg 4)
5/8" x 8" Curved 9' lengths | $0-96 | 16.55lbs | $15.89 5/8" x 8" Curved 9' lengths 16.21lbs | $16.11
5/8" x 8" Flat $0.93 | 15.431bs $14.35 5/8" x 8" Flat 16.21lbs | $16.14
Underbody Blades Underbody Blades
Hardened Blades Hardened Blades

$18.75

5/8" -7/8" x 8 6'or7' No Bid 5/8" - 7/8" x 8" 6'or 7' 25.00lbs | 1" by
length length 8"
Sectional Tungsten Sectional Tungsten
Carbide Blades(Pg 6} Carbide Blades{Pg 6)
5/8" x 6" Curved 4' lengths $5.76 | 12.251bs $70.56 5/8" x 6" Curved 4' lengths no hid
3/4" x 6" Flat 4' lengths | $4-24 | 14.75lbs | $62.54 3/4" x 6" Flat 4' lengths no bid
7/8" x 5" Flat 4' lengths $4.38 14.251bs 562.44 7/8" X 5" Flat 4' lengths no bid
Serrated lce Blades(Pg 7) $1.15 | 9.00Ibs $10.35 Serrated 1ce Blades{Pg 7)
3-3/8" space, 1-5/8" tooth | $1:15 | 9.001bs | $10.35 3-3/8" space, 1-5/8" tooth 12.3 Ibs | $13.95
1-3/16" space, 2-1/8" tooth $1.15 | 9.00lbs | $10.35 1-3/16" space, 2-1/8" tooth no bid
Carbide Bit Moldboard Carbide Bit Moldboard
Blades Blades
:I:):g; Grader Moldboard $8.61 | 23.67Ibs | $203.78 gllo:g; Grader Moldboard no bid
Truck Underbody Moldboard $7.36 23.67lbs | $174.21 Truck Underbody Moldboard no bid
Blade Blade
Carbide Bit Tools Carbide Bit Tools
Motor Grader Blades Per 60pc $648.60 Vbtor Grader Blades Per no bid
Qty Specified Qty Specified
Truck Underbody Blades 80pc $525.60 Truck Underbody Blades Per no bid

St. Regis Culvert Inc.— Submitted, NO BID
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