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2020 Grader Blade Material Bid O/‘/Q W l ‘LLN (m
#0-07 Ded- IMentsr- C

Valk Manufacturing Company Wear Parts & Equipment Co., Inc

[tem $/lbs weight/ft S/ft [tem $/lbs weight/ft $/ft

Front Plow Blades Front Plow Blades

High Carbon Steel Cutting High Carbon Steel Cutting

Edges (Pg 3) Edges (Pg 3)

614 17 10.44 0.65 17.00 11.05

5/8" x 8" - &' or 7' lengths 5/8" x 8" - 6' or 7' lengths

Wing Plow Blades Wing Plow Blades

High Carbon Steel Cutting High Carbon Steel Gutting

Edges (Pg 4) Edges (Pg 4)

5/8" x 8" Curved 9'lengths 81 16.21 13.13 5/8" x 8" Curved 9' lengths 1.08 16.56 17.48

5/8" x 8" Flat .81 16.21 13.13 5/8" x 8" Flat 1.06 16.56 17.48

Underbody Blades Underbody Blades

Hardened Blades Hardened Blades

508" - 7/8" x 8" 6 or 7' length 75 25 18.75 5/8"-7/8"x 8" 6 or 7' length 1.27 19.67 24.92

Sectional Tungsten Carbide Sectional Tungsten Carbide

Blades(Pg 6) Blades(Pg 6)

5/8" x 6" Curved 4'lengths No Bid 5/8" x 6" Curved 4' lengths 546 15.25 83.19

314" x 6" Flat 4' lengths No Bid 3/4" x 6" Flat 4'lengths 578 16.00 92.52

718" x 5" Flat 4' lengths No Bid 7/8" x 5" Flat 4' lengths 578 16.00 92.52

Serrated Ice Blades(Pg 7) Serrated Ice Blades(Pg 7)

3-3/8" space, 1-5/8" tooth 10 12.94 3-3/8" space, 1-5/8" tooth 1.08 12.33 13.29

1-3/16" space, 2-1/8" tooth 10 12.94 1-3116" space, 2-1/8" tooth 1.08 13.33 13.29

Carbide Bit Moldboard Blades Carbide Bit Moldboard Blades

Motor Grader Moldboard Blade No Bid Motor Grader Moldboard Blade 8.63 23.75 204.97

Truck Underbody Moldboard No Bid 7.38 23.75 175.16

Blade Truck Underbody Moldboard Blade

Carbide Bit Tools Carbide Bit Tools

Motor Grader Blades Per Oty Specified No Bid Motor Grader Blades Per Qty Specified | 00 Per POX 11.30/ea

Truck Underbody Blades Per Qty No Bid Truck Underbody Blades Per Qty 80 per box 6.88/ea

Specified Specified
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St. Regis Culvert, Inc.

Winter Equipment Company, Inc.

ftem $/lbs | weight/ft S/ft Item $/lbs | weight/ft s/ft
Front Plow Blades Front Plow Blades
High Carbon Steel Cutting High Carbon Steel Cutting
Edges (Pg 3) Edges (Pg 3)

0 17 16.30 No Bid
5/8" x 8" - 6' or 7' lengths 5/8" x 8" - 6' or 7' lengths
Wing Plow Blades Wing Plow Blades
High Carbon Steel Cutting High Carbon Steel Cutting
Edges (Pg 4) Edges (Pg 4)
5/8" x 8" Curved 9' lengths 0 15.4 18.50 5/8" x 8" Curved 9' lengths No Bid
5/8" x 8" Flat 0 154 18.50 5/8" x 8" Flat No Bid
Underbody Blades Underbody Blades
Hardened Blades Hardened Blades
5/8" - 7/8" x 8" _6'or 7'length No Bid 5/8"- 7/8" x 8" 6'or 7" length No Bid
Sectional Tungsten Carbide Sectional Tungsten Carbide
Blades(Pg 6) Blades(Pg 6)
5/8" x 6" Curved 4' lengths No Bid 5/8" x 6" Curved 4' lengths No Bid
304" x 6" Flat 4' lengths No Bid 3/4" x 6" Flat 4' lengths No Bid
7/8" x 5" Flat 4' lengths No Bid 718" x 5" Flat 4' lengths No Bid
Serrated Ice Blades(Pg 7) Serrated Ice Blades(Pg 7)
3-3/8" space, 1-5/8" tooth No Bid 3-3/8" space, 1-5/8" tooth No Bid
1-3/116" space, 2-1/8" tooth No Bid 1-316" space, 2-1/8" tooth No Bid
Carbide Bit Moldboard Blades Carbide Bit Moldboard Blades
Motor Grader Moldboard Blade No Bid Motor Grader Moldboard Blade No Bid
Truck Underbody Moldboard No Bid No Bid
Blade Truck Underbody Moldboard Blade
Carbide Bit Tools Carbide Bit Tools
Motor Grader Blades Per Qty No Bid Motor Grader Blades Per Qty :gr 11.26
Specified Specified box
Truck Underbody Blades Per Qty No Bid Truck Underbody Blades Per Qty s:r 5.80
Specified Specified Box
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Heights Machinery, Inc

Truck and Trailer Specialies.

Item $/lbs | weight/ft S/ft [tem $/lbs | weight/ft $/ft
Front Plow Blades Front Plow Blades
High Carbon Steel Cutting High Carbon Steel Cutting
Edges (Pg 3) Edges (Pg 3)

17 10.58 .68 16.83 11.00
5/8" x 8" - 6' or 7' lengths 5/8" x 8" - 6' or 7' lengths
Wing Plow Blades Wing Plow Blades
High Carbon Steel Cutting High Carbon Steel Cutting
Edges (Pg 4) Edges (Pg 4)
5/8" x 8 Curved 9' lengths 15.44 11.78 5/8" x 8" Curved 9 lengths 78 16.11 12.56
518" x 8" Flat 1544 | 1178 5/8" x 8" Flat 78 16 12:40
Underbody Blades Underbody Blades
Hardened Blades Hardened Blades
5/8"- 718" x 8 6 or 7' length No Bid 5/8"- 7/8"x 8" 6 or 7' length 102 | 1966 | 2003
Sectional Tungsten Carhide Sectional Tungsten Carbide
Blades(Pg 6) Blades(Pg 6)
5/8" x 6" Curved 4' lengths 16.75 | 84.85 5/8" x 6" Gurved 4' lengths 398 | 1525 3.86
63.203/4" x 6" Flat 4' lengths 1583 | 7875 3/4" x 6" Flat 4'lengths 395 16 63.20
718" 5" Flat 4'lengths 1525 | 7575 718" x 5" Flat 4'lengths 4.18 15 62.70
Serrated Ice Blades(Pg 7) Setrated Ice Blades(Pg 7)
3-3/8" space, 1-5/8" tooth 1233 13.14 3-3/8" space, 1-5/8" tooth 1.72 10.50 18.06
1-3/16" space, 2-1/8" tooth 1238 | 13.14 1-3116" space, 2-1/8" tooth 121 | 1250 | 15.06
Carbide Bit Moldboard Blades Carbide Bit Moldboard Blades
Motor Grader Moldboard Blade 23.75 | 165.80 Motor Grader Moldooard Blade 9.78 | 17.75 | 17359
Truck Underbody Moldboard 23.75 141.68 9.78 17.75 173.59
Blade Truck Underbody Moldboard Blade
Carbide Bit Tools Carbide Bit Tools
Motor Grader Blades Per Qty 1217 Motor Grader Blades Per Qty :é)r 13.55
Specified Specified box
Truck Underbody Blades Per Qty 7.37 Truck Underbody Blades Per Qty p62r 6.99
Specified Specified box
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